



SIGN BID	ADD	PARTS	LOC #1	LOC #2	LOC #3	LOC #4	LOC #5	LOC #6	LOC #7	LOC #8	LOC #9	LOC #10	LOC #11	LOC #12	LOC #13	LOC #14	LOC #15	Sub-Totals	Occurances	Alt. 1	Total	Totals	
			JJC	JC	SHERIFF & JAIL	DEPT OF TRANS	HLTH DEPT (AURORA)	CRT SRVCS (AURORA)	GOVT CENTER	ANIMAL CONTROL	BLDG MGMT SHER MAINT	SHERIFF & JAIL	HLTH DEPT (AURORA - VAC LOT)	JC (FESCUE AREA)	JC (POND AREA)	KBC	3RD ST CRTHOUSE						
ACRES GROUP 23940 W. Andrew Rd Plainfield, IL 60585 630.975.1426	X	1	PART 1	\$ 170.00	\$ 496.00	\$ 204.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 480.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 150.00		\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 2,677.00	32		\$ 85,664.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	6		\$ 600.00
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	6		\$ 600.00
			PART 2C	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	4		\$ 400.00
			PART 2D	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	4		\$ 400.00
			PART 2E	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	4		\$ 400.00
			PART 3	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	4		\$ 400.00
			PART 4	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 15.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 515.00	2		\$ 1,030.00
			PART 5	\$ 85.00	\$ 248.00	\$ 102.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 65.00							\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 825.00	1		\$ 825.00
			PART 6B	\$ 354.00	\$1,054.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 230.00							\$ 35.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 3,223.00	3		\$ 9,669.00
			PART 6C	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 440.00	1		\$ 440.00
			PART 6D	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 440.00	1		\$ 440.00
			PART 6E	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 440.00	1		\$ 440.00
			PART 7			\$ 50.00				\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 190.00	1		\$ 190.00
PART 8															\$ 275.00		\$ 275.00	1		\$ 275.00			
ALT #1	\$ 62.00																\$ 62.00	500	\$ 31,000.00	\$ 101,773.00			
CORNERSTONE PARTNERS HORTICULTURAL SERVICES P.O. Box 745 St. Charles, IL 60174 630.482.9950	X	1	PART 1	\$ 240.01	\$ 469.64	\$ 115.32	\$ 162.20	\$ 55.80	\$ 91.98	\$ 201.58	\$ 66.09	\$ 760.62	\$ 1,079.40	\$ 481.59	\$ 2,409.94		\$ 39.05	\$ 150.74	\$ 6,323.96	32		\$ 202,366.72	
			PART 2A	\$ 2.72	\$ 8.16	\$ 32.64	\$ 5.44	\$ 31.14	\$ 10.88	\$ 16.32	\$ 5.44							\$ 8.16	\$ 35.36	\$ 156.26	6		\$ 937.56
			PART 2B	\$ 35.36	\$ 40.80	\$ 32.64	\$ 5.44	\$ 5.44	\$ 16.32	\$ 16.32	\$ 5.44							\$ 10.88	\$ 35.36	\$ 204.00	6		\$ 1,224.00
			PART 2C	\$ 142.33	\$ 1,003.23	\$ 201.44	\$ 272.59	\$ 51.44	\$ 118.58	\$ 319.87	\$ 166.03							No Bid	\$ 453.76	\$ 2,729.27	4		\$ 10,917.08
			PART 2D	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	4		\$ -
			PART 2E	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	4		\$ -
			PART 3	\$ 21.08	\$ 390.60	\$ 12.71	\$ 123.54	\$ 10.42	\$ 9.18	\$ 168.89	\$ 11.41							\$ 92.33	\$ 12.74	\$ 852.90	4		\$ 3,411.60
			PART 4	\$ 128.85	\$ 1,596.49	\$ 195.09	\$ 809.16	\$ 38.08	\$ 53.37	\$ 616.84	\$ 109.10							\$ 414.33	\$ 297.88	\$ 4,259.19	2		\$ 8,518.38
			PART 5	\$ 1,300.01	\$ 5,686.98	\$ 887.87	\$ 1,780.53	\$ 233.55	\$ 418.97	\$ 2,072.91	\$ 367.47							\$ 299.68	\$ 502.07	\$ 13,550.04	1		\$ 13,550.04
			PART 6B	\$ 1,420.63	\$ 3,636.52	\$ 541.99	\$ 1,079.19	\$ 216.33	\$ 404.49	\$ 1,265.16	\$ 305.40							\$ 153.99	\$ 479.51	\$ 9,503.21	3		\$ 28,509.63
			PART 6C	\$ 1,482.87	\$ 3,798.53	\$ 562.22	\$ 1,124.45	\$ 133.53	\$ 291.65	\$ 1,321.23	\$ 221.38							\$ 35.14	\$ 347.88	\$ 9,318.88	1		\$ 9,318.88
			PART 6D	\$ 31.88	\$ 534.24	\$ 52.49	\$ 203.60	\$ 52.49	\$ 55.92	\$ 238.90	\$ 52.49							\$ 144.24	\$ 55.92	\$ 1,422.17	1		\$ 1,422.17
			PART 6E	\$ 153.78	\$ 648.71	\$ 143.25	\$ 340.60	\$ 104.55	\$ 104.55	\$ 347.47	\$ 116.11							\$ 122.85	\$ 122.85	\$ 2,204.72	1		\$ 2,204.72
			PART 7			\$ 413.58				\$ 117.51	\$ 358.06							\$ 385.82	\$ 433.13	\$ 1,708.10	1		\$ 1,708.10
PART 8															\$ 5,709.95		\$ 5,709.95	1		\$ 5,709.95			
ALT #1	\$ 64.82																\$ 64.82	500	\$ 32,410.00	\$ 289,798.83			
COUNTY WIDE LANDSCAPE 42W891 Beith Rd Elburn, IL 60199 630.659.6231	X	NO	PART 1	\$ 70.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 132.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 415.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 850.00		\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 2,904.00	32		\$ 92,928.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 20.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 37.50	\$ 12.00							\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 200.50	6		\$ 1,203.00
			PART 2B	\$ 20.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 37.50	\$ 12.00							\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 200.50	6		\$ 1,203.00
			PART 2C	\$ 170.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 148.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 318.00	\$ 95.00							\$ 68.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 1,654.00	4		\$ 6,616.00
			PART 2D	\$ 150.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 94.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 84.00							\$ 60.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 1,458.00	4		\$ 5,832.00
			PART 2E	\$ 120.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 68.00							\$ 48.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 1,174.00	4		\$ 4,696.00
			PART 3	\$ 75.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 45.00							\$ 30.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 740.00	4		\$ 2,960.00
			PART 4	\$ 200.00	\$ 505.00	\$ 178.00	\$ 205.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 126.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,974.00	2		\$ 3,948.00
			PART 5	\$ 200.00	\$ 505.00	\$ 178.00	\$ 205.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 126.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,974.00	1		\$ 1,974.00
			PART 6B	\$ 200.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,955.00	3		\$ 5,865.00
			PART 6C	\$ 200.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,955.00	1		\$ 1,955.00
			PART 6D	\$ 200.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,955.00	1		\$ 1,955.00
			PART 6E	\$ 200.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,955.00	1		\$ 1,955.00
			PART 7			\$ 425.00				\$ 700.00	\$ 300.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,755.00	1		\$ 1,755.00
PART 8															\$ 1,050.00		\$ 1,050.00	1		\$ 1,050.00			
ALT #1	\$ 70.00																\$ 70.00	500	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 135,895.00			

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15
- Part 8 only applies to Location #13

			LOC #1	LOC #2	LOC #3	LOC #4	LOC #5	LOC #6	LOC #7	LOC #8	LOC #9	LOC #10	LOC #11	LOC #12	LOC #13	LOC #14	LOC #15	Sub-Totals	Occurances	Alt. 1		Totals	
SIGN BID	ADD	PARTS	JJC	JC	SHERIFF & JAIL	DEPT OF TRANS	HLTH DEPT (AURORA)	CRT SRVCS (AURORA)	GOVT CENTER	ANIMAL CONTROL	BLDG MGMT SHER MAINT	SHERIFF & JAIL	HLTH DEPT (AURORA - VAC LOT)	JC (FESCUE AREA)	JC (POND AREA)	KBC	3RD ST CRTHOUSE			Total	Total		
TWIN OAKS LANDSCAPING 997 Harvey Oswego, IL 60543 630.554.3399	X	1	PART 1	\$ 100.00	\$ 185.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 150.00		\$ 30.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 1,435.00	32		\$ 45,920.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 110.00	6		\$ 660.00
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 110.00	6		\$ 660.00
			PART 2C	\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 225.00	4		\$ 900.00
			PART 2D	\$ 60.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 5.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 370.00	4		\$ 1,480.00
			PART 2E	\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 220.00	4		\$ 880.00
			PART 3	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 45.00							\$ 30.00	\$ 207.00	\$ 827.00	4		\$ 3,308.00
			PART 4	\$ 75.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 75.00							\$ 65.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 975.00	2		\$ 1,950.00
			PART 5	\$ 100.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 45.00							\$ 75.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,460.00	1		\$ 1,460.00
			PART 6B	\$ 437.00	\$ 660.00	\$ 720.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 690.00	\$ 140.00							\$ 45.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 3,372.00	3		\$ 10,116.00
			PART 6C	\$ 150.00	\$ 705.00	\$ 830.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 605.00	\$ 65.00							\$ 75.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 3,125.00	1		\$ 3,125.00
			PART 6D	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 20.00							\$ 45.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 590.00	1		\$ 590.00
			PART 6E	\$ 50.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 410.00	1		\$ 410.00
			PART 7			\$ 160.00				\$ 160.00	\$ 120.00							\$ 35.00	\$ 215.00	\$ 690.00	1		\$ 690.00
PART 8														\$ 1,700.00			\$ 1,700.00	1		\$ 1,700.00			
ALT #1	\$ 45.00																\$ 45.00	500	\$ 22,500.00	\$ 73,849.00			
WA MANAGEMENT, INC P.O. Box 844 West Chicago, IL 60186 630.876.0860	X	1	PART 1	\$ 88.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 400.00		\$ 23.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 2,638.00	32		\$ 84,416.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 21.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 126.50	6		\$ 759.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 21.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 126.50	6		\$ 759.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 5.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 210.50	4		\$ 842.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 5.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 205.50	4		\$ 822.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 5.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 226.00	4		\$ 904.00	
			PART 3	\$ 5.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 215.50	4		\$ 862.00	
			PART 4	\$ 10.00	\$ 127.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00						\$ 12.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 306.50	2		\$ 613.00	
			PART 5	\$ 13.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 215.00	\$ 60.00						\$ 200.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,613.00	1		\$ 1,613.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 100.00	\$ 870.00	\$ 211.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 50.00						\$ 100.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 2,286.00	3		\$ 6,858.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 300.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 684.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 25.00						\$ 150.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 4,614.00	1		\$ 4,614.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 15.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 15.00						\$ 20.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 706.00	1		\$ 706.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 15.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 20.00						\$ 30.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 914.00	1		\$ 914.00	
			PART 7			\$ 78.00				\$ 76.00	\$ 70.00						\$ 48.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 362.00	1		\$ 362.00	
PART 8													\$ 800.00			\$ 800.00	1		\$ 800.00				
ALT #1	\$ 38.00															\$ 38.00	500	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 105,844.00				
WINTERS LANDSCAPE 50W410 Marcy Rd Sycamore, IL 60178 847.721.1428	X	NO	PART 1	\$ 350.00	\$ 630.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 1,500.00		\$ 15.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 5,850.00	32		\$ 187,200.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 18.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 20.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 279.00	6		\$ 1,674.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 35.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 20.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 296.00	6		\$ 1,776.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 280.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 35.00						No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 1,160.00	4		\$ 4,640.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 140.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 20.00						No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 995.00	4		\$ 3,980.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 70.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 20.00						No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 1,205.00	4		\$ 4,820.00	
			PART 3	\$ 210.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 20.00						\$ 35.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 1,105.00	4		\$ 4,420.00	
			PART 4	\$ 420.00	\$ 2,240.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 140.00						\$ 35.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 4,165.00	2		\$ 8,330.00	
			PART 5	\$ 280.00	\$ 1,120.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 280.00						\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 3,500.00	1		\$ 3,500.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 825.00	\$ 1,410.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 360.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 675.00	\$ 330.00						\$ 45.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 4,280.00	3		\$ 12,840.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 55.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00						\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 475.00	1		\$ 475.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 55.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00						\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 475.00	1		\$ 475.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 55.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00						\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 475.00	1		\$ 475.00	
			PART 7			\$ 35.00				\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00						\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 245.00	1		\$ 245.00	
PART 8													No Bid			\$ -	1		\$ -				
ALT #1	\$ 55.00															\$ 55.00	500	\$ 27,500.00	\$ 234,850.00				

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15

- Part 8 only applies to Location #13

SIGN BID	ADD	PARTS	LOC #1	LOC #2	LOC #3	LOC #4	LOC #5	LOC #6	LOC #7	LOC #8	LOC #9	LOC #10	LOC #11	LOC #12	LOC #13	LOC #14	LOC #15	Sub-Totals	Occurances	Alt. 1	Total	Totals	
			JJC	JC	SHERIFF & JAIL	DEPT OF TRANS	HLTH DEPT (AURORA)	CRT SRVCS (AURORA)	GOVT CENTER	ANIMAL CONTROL	BLDG MGMT SHER MAINT	SHERIFF & JAIL	HLTH DEPT (AURORA - VAC LOT)	JC (FESCUE AREA)	JC (POND AREA)	KBC	3RD ST CRTHOUSE						
CHRISTY WEBBER LANDSCAPES 2900West Ferdinand St Chicago, IL 60612 773.533.0477	X	1	PART 1	\$ 600.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 155.00	\$ 218.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 435.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,000.00		\$ 90.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 6,193.00	32		\$ 198,176.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 20.00							\$ 35.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 455.00	6		\$ 2,730.00
			PART 2B	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 20.00							\$ 35.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 405.00	6		\$ 2,430.00
			PART 2C	\$ 140.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 25.00							\$ 100.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 712.00	4		\$ 2,848.00
			PART 2D	\$ 140.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 25.00							\$ 75.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 687.00	4		\$ 2,748.00
			PART 2E	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 25.00							\$ 100.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 672.00	4		\$ 2,688.00
			PART 3	\$ 125.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00							\$ 200.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 807.00	4		\$ 3,228.00
			PART 4	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 35.00							\$ 100.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 1,175.00	2		\$ 2,350.00
			PART 5	\$ 1,820.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 230.00							\$ 250.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 6,290.00	1		\$ 6,290.00
			PART 6B	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 400.00							\$ 400.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 7,580.00	3		\$ 22,740.00
			PART 6C	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 50.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 9,880.00	1		\$ 9,880.00
			PART 6D	\$ 475.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 70.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 2,035.00	1		\$ 2,035.00
			PART 6E	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 50.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,965.00	1		\$ 1,965.00
			PART 7			\$ 1,150.00				\$ 150.00	\$ 950.00							\$ 800.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,550.00	1		\$ 4,550.00
PART 8														\$ 1,500.00			\$ 1,500.00	1		\$ 1,500.00			
ALT #1	\$ 60.00																\$ 60.00	500	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 266,158.00			
SEBERT LANDSCAPE 30W741 Butterfiled Rd Naperville, IL 630.236.9350	X	1	PART 1	\$ 190.00	\$ 490.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 1,400.00		\$ 75.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 4,380.00	32		\$ 140,160.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	6		\$ 600.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	6		\$ 600.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 30.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 350.00	4		\$ 1,400.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 40.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 445.00	4		\$ 1,780.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 15.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 265.00	4		\$ 1,060.00	
			PART 3	\$ 100.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 30.00						\$ 50.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,795.00	4		\$ 7,180.00	
			PART 4	\$ 150.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 45.00						\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 1,805.00	2		\$ 3,610.00	
			PART 5	\$ 200.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 175.00						\$ 150.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 3,405.00	1		\$ 3,405.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 500.00						\$ 100.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 3,880.00	3		\$ 11,640.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 350.00						\$ 80.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 3,800.00	1		\$ 3,800.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 100.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 40.00						\$ 60.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,240.00	1		\$ 1,240.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 50.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 30.00						\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 765.00	1		\$ 765.00	
			PART 7			\$ 400.00				\$ 65.00	\$ 300.00						\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 965.00	1		\$ 965.00	
PART 8													\$ 3,500.00			\$ 3,500.00	1		\$ 3,500.00				
ALT #1	\$ 55.00															\$ 55.00	500	\$ 27,500.00	\$ 181,705.00				
LOCAL LAWN CARE & LANDSCAPING 10 s 112 Schoger Dr Naperville, IL 60564 630.338.5793	X	1	PART 1	\$ 128.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 400.00		\$ 70.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 2,493.00	32		\$ 79,776.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 5.00						\$ 5.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 260.00	6		\$ 1,560.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 5.00						\$ 5.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 370.00	6		\$ 2,220.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 150.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 25.00						No Bid	\$ 310.00	\$ 1,575.00	4		\$ 6,300.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 150.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 25.00						No Bid	\$ 180.00	\$ 1,065.00	4		\$ 4,260.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 150.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 25.00						No Bid	\$ 180.00	\$ 1,465.00	4		\$ 5,860.00	
			PART 3	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 475.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 40.00						\$ 290.00	\$ 149.00	\$ 2,379.00	4		\$ 9,516.00	
			PART 4	\$ 370.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 855.00	\$ 60.00						\$ 385.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 4,105.00	2		\$ 8,210.00	
			PART 5	\$ 320.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 690.00	\$ 75.00						\$ 195.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 2,510.00	1		\$ 2,510.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 575.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 410.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 880.00	\$ 185.00						\$ 60.00	\$ 265.00	\$ 4,005.00	3		\$ 12,015.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 600.00	\$ 975.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 1,110.00	\$ 195.00						\$ 85.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 4,610.00	1		\$ 4,610.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 75.00	\$ 710.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 145.00						\$ 110.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 2,090.00	1		\$ 2,090.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 145.00	\$ 620.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 110.00						\$ 45.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 2,420.00	1		\$ 2,420.00	
			PART 7			\$ 1,850.00				\$ 590.00	\$ 2,368.00						\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,980.00	\$ 7,913.00	1		\$ 7,913.00	
PART 8													\$ 1,095.00			\$ 1,095.00	1		\$ 1,095.00				
ALT #1	\$ 75.00															\$ 75.00	500	\$ 37,500.00	\$ 150,355.00				

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15

- Part 8 only applies to Location #13



SIGN BID	ADD	PARTS	LOC #1	LOC #2	LOC #3	LOC #4	LOC #5	LOC #6	LOC #7	LOC #8	LOC #9	LOC #10	LOC #11	LOC #12	LOC #13	LOC #14	LOC #15	Sub-Totals	Occurances	Alt. 1	Total	Totals		
			JJC	JC	SHERIFF & JAIL	DEPT OF TRANS	HLTH DEPT (AURORA)	CRT SRVCS (AURORA)	GOVT CENTER	ANIMAL CONTROL	BLDG MGMT SHER MAINT	SHERIFF & JAIL	HLTH DEPT (AURORA - VAC LOT)	JC (FESCUE AREA)	JC (POND AREA)	KBC	3RD ST CRTHOUSE							
ACRES GROUP 23940 W. Andrew Rd Plainfield, IL 60585 630.975.1426	X	1	PART 1	\$ 170.00	\$ 496.00	\$ 204.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 480.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 150.00		\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 2,677.00	32		\$ 85,664.00		
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00							\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	6		\$ 600.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00								\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	6		\$ 600.00
			PART 2C	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00								\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	4		\$ 400.00
			PART 2D	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00								\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	4		\$ 400.00
			PART 2E	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00								\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	4		\$ 400.00
			PART 3	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00								\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	4		\$ 400.00
			PART 4	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00								\$ 15.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 515.00	2		\$ 1,030.00
			PART 5	\$ 85.00	\$ 248.00	\$ 102.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 65.00								\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 825.00	1		\$ 825.00
			PART 6B	\$ 354.00	\$1,054.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 230.00								\$ 35.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 3,223.00	3		\$ 9,669.00
			PART 6C	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00								\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 440.00	1		\$ 440.00
			PART 6D	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00								\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 440.00	1		\$ 440.00
			PART 6E	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00								\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 440.00	1		\$ 440.00
			PART 7			\$ 50.00				\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00								\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 190.00	1		\$ 190.00
PART 8															\$ 275.00			\$ 275.00	1		\$ 275.00			
ALT #1	\$ 62.00																	\$ 62.00	500	\$ 31,000.00	\$ 101,773.00			
CORNERSTONE PARTNERS HORTICULTURAL SERVICES P.O. Box 745 St. Charles, IL 60174 630.482.9950	X	1	PART 1	\$ 240.01	\$ 469.64	\$ 115.32	\$ 162.20	\$ 55.80	\$ 91.98	\$ 201.58	\$ 66.09	\$ 760.62	\$ 1,079.40	\$ 481.59	\$ 2,409.94		\$ 39.05	\$ 150.74	\$ 6,323.96	32		\$ 202,366.72		
			PART 2A	\$ 2.72	\$ 8.16	\$ 32.64	\$ 5.44	\$ 31.14	\$ 10.88	\$ 16.32	\$ 5.44							\$ 8.16	\$ 35.36	\$ 156.26	6		\$ 937.56	
			PART 2B	\$ 35.36	\$ 40.80	\$ 32.64	\$ 5.44	\$ 5.44	\$ 16.32	\$ 16.32	\$ 5.44							\$ 10.88	\$ 35.36	\$ 204.00	6		\$ 1,224.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 142.33	\$ 1,003.23	\$ 201.44	\$ 272.59	\$ 51.44	\$ 118.58	\$ 319.87	\$ 166.03							No Bid	\$ 453.76	\$ 2,729.27	4		\$ 10,917.08	
			PART 2D	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	4		\$ -	
			PART 2E	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	4		\$ -	
			PART 3	\$ 21.08	\$ 390.60	\$ 12.71	\$ 123.54	\$ 10.42	\$ 9.18	\$ 168.89	\$ 11.41							\$ 92.33	\$ 12.74	\$ 852.90	4		\$ 3,411.60	
			PART 4	\$ 128.85	\$ 1,596.49	\$ 195.09	\$ 809.16	\$ 38.08	\$ 53.37	\$ 616.84	\$ 109.10							\$ 414.33	\$ 297.88	\$ 4,259.19	2		\$ 8,518.38	
			PART 5	\$ 1,300.01	\$ 5,686.98	\$ 887.87	\$ 1,780.53	\$ 233.55	\$ 418.97	\$ 2,072.91	\$ 367.47							\$ 299.68	\$ 502.07	\$ 13,550.04	1		\$ 13,550.04	
			PART 6B	\$ 1,420.63	\$ 3,636.52	\$ 541.99	\$ 1,079.19	\$ 216.33	\$ 404.49	\$ 1,265.16	\$ 305.40							\$ 153.99	\$ 479.51	\$ 9,503.21	3		\$ 28,509.63	
			PART 6C	\$ 1,482.87	\$ 3,798.53	\$ 562.22	\$ 1,124.45	\$ 133.53	\$ 291.65	\$ 1,321.23	\$ 221.38							\$ 35.14	\$ 347.88	\$ 9,318.88	1		\$ 9,318.88	
			PART 6D	\$ 31.88	\$ 534.24	\$ 52.49	\$ 203.60	\$ 52.49	\$ 55.92	\$ 238.90	\$ 52.49							\$ 144.24	\$ 55.92	\$ 1,422.17	1		\$ 1,422.17	
			PART 6E	\$ 153.78	\$ 648.71	\$ 143.25	\$ 340.60	\$ 104.55	\$ 104.55	\$ 347.47	\$ 116.11							\$ 122.85	\$ 122.85	\$ 2,204.72	1		\$ 2,204.72	
			PART 7			\$ 413.58				\$ 117.51	\$ 358.06							\$ 385.82	\$ 433.13	\$ 1,708.10	1		\$ 1,708.10	
PART 8															\$ 5,709.95		\$ 5,709.95	1		\$ 5,709.95				
ALT #1	\$ 64.82																	\$ 64.82	500	\$ 32,410.00	\$ 289,798.83			
COUNTY WIDE LANDSCAPE 42W891 Beith Rd Elburn, IL 60199 630.659.6231	X	NO	PART 1	\$ 70.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 132.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 415.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 850.00		\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 2,904.00	32		\$ 92,928.00		
			PART 2A	\$ 20.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 37.50	\$ 12.00							\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 200.50	6		\$ 1,203.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 20.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 37.50	\$ 12.00							\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 200.50	6		\$ 1,203.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 170.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 148.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 318.00	\$ 95.00							\$ 68.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 1,654.00	4		\$ 6,616.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 150.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 94.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 84.00							\$ 60.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 1,458.00	4		\$ 5,832.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 120.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 68.00							\$ 48.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 1,174.00	4		\$ 4,696.00	
			PART 3	\$ 75.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 45.00							\$ 30.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 740.00	4		\$ 2,960.00	
			PART 4	\$ 200.00	\$ 505.00	\$ 178.00	\$ 205.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 126.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,974.00	2		\$ 3,948.00	
			PART 5	\$ 200.00	\$ 505.00	\$ 178.00	\$ 205.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 126.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,974.00	1		\$ 1,974.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 200.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,955.00	3		\$ 5,865.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 200.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,955.00	1		\$ 1,955.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 200.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,955.00	1		\$ 1,955.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 200.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 115.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 1,955.00	1		\$ 1,955.00	
			PART 7			\$ 425.00				\$ 700.00	\$ 300.00							\$ 80.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,755.00	1		\$ 1,755.00	
PART 8															\$ 1,050.00		\$ 1,050.00	1		\$ 1,050.00				
ALT #1	\$ 70.00																	\$ 70.00	500	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 135,895.00			

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15
- Part 8 only applies to Location #13

SIGN BID	ADD	PARTS	LOC #1	LOC #2	LOC #3	LOC #4	LOC #5	LOC #6	LOC #7	LOC #8	LOC #9	LOC #10	LOC #11	LOC #12	LOC #13	LOC #14	LOC #15	Sub-Totals	Occurances	Alt. 1	Total	Totals
			JJC	JC	SHERIFF & JAIL	DEPT OF TRANS	HLTH DEPT (AURORA)	CRT SRVCS (AURORA)	GOVT CENTER	ANIMAL CONTROL	BLDG MGMT SHER MAINT	SHERIFF & JAIL	HLTH DEPT (AURORA - VAC LOT)	JC (FESCUE AREA)	JC (POND AREA)	KBC	3RD ST CRTHOUSE					
TWIN OAKS LANDSCAPING 997 Harvey Oswego, IL 60543 630.554.3399	X	1	PART 1	\$ 100.00	\$ 185.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 1,435.00	32		\$ 45,920.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 110.00	6		\$ 660.00
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 110.00	6		\$ 660.00
			PART 2C	\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 225.00	4		\$ 900.00
			PART 2D	\$ 60.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 5.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 370.00	4		\$ 1,480.00
			PART 2E	\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 220.00	4		\$ 880.00
			PART 3	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 45.00						\$ 30.00	\$ 207.00	\$ 827.00	4		\$ 3,308.00
			PART 4	\$ 75.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 75.00						\$ 65.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 975.00	2		\$ 1,950.00
			PART 5	\$ 100.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 45.00						\$ 75.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,460.00	1		\$ 1,460.00
			PART 6B	\$ 437.00	\$ 660.00	\$ 720.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 690.00	\$ 140.00						\$ 45.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 3,372.00	3		\$ 10,116.00
			PART 6C	\$ 150.00	\$ 705.00	\$ 830.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 605.00	\$ 65.00						\$ 75.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 3,125.00	1		\$ 3,125.00
			PART 6D	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 20.00						\$ 45.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 590.00	1		\$ 590.00
			PART 6E	\$ 50.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 410.00	1		\$ 410.00
			PART 7			\$ 160.00				\$ 160.00	\$ 120.00						\$ 35.00	\$ 215.00	\$ 690.00	1		\$ 690.00
PART 8														\$ 1,700.00		\$ 1,700.00	1		\$ 1,700.00			
ALT #1	\$ 45.00															\$ 45.00	500	\$ 22,500.00	\$ 73,849.00			
WA MANAGEMENT, INC P.O. Box 844 West Chicago, IL 60186 630.876.0860	X	1	PART 1	\$ 88.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 2,638.00	32		\$ 84,416.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 21.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00					\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 126.50	6		\$ 759.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 21.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00					\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 126.50	6		\$ 759.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 5.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 10.00					\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 210.50	4		\$ 842.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 5.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 10.00					\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 205.50	4		\$ 822.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 5.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 10.00					\$ 15.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 226.00	4		\$ 904.00	
			PART 3	\$ 5.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 10.00					\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 215.50	4		\$ 862.00	
			PART 4	\$ 10.00	\$ 127.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00					\$ 12.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 306.50	2		\$ 613.00	
			PART 5	\$ 13.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 215.00	\$ 60.00					\$ 200.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,613.00	1		\$ 1,613.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 100.00	\$ 870.00	\$ 211.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 50.00					\$ 100.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 2,286.00	3		\$ 6,858.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 300.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 684.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 25.00					\$ 150.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 4,614.00	1		\$ 4,614.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 15.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 15.00					\$ 20.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 706.00	1		\$ 706.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 15.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 20.00					\$ 30.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 914.00	1		\$ 914.00	
			PART 7			\$ 78.00				\$ 76.00	\$ 70.00					\$ 48.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 362.00	1		\$ 362.00	
PART 8													\$ 800.00		\$ 800.00	1		\$ 800.00				
ALT #1	\$ 38.00														\$ 38.00	500	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 105,844.00				
WINTERS LANDSCAPE 50W410 Marcy Rd Sycamore, IL 60178 847.721.1428	X	NO	PART 1	\$ 350.00	\$ 630.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 5,850.00	32		\$ 187,200.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 18.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 20.00					\$ 15.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 279.00	6		\$ 1,674.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 35.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 20.00					\$ 15.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 296.00	6		\$ 1,776.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 280.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 35.00					No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 1,160.00	4		\$ 4,640.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 140.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 20.00					No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 995.00	4		\$ 3,980.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 70.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 20.00					No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 1,205.00	4		\$ 4,820.00	
			PART 3	\$ 210.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 20.00					\$ 35.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 1,105.00	4		\$ 4,420.00	
			PART 4	\$ 420.00	\$ 2,240.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 140.00					\$ 35.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 4,165.00	2		\$ 8,330.00	
			PART 5	\$ 280.00	\$ 1,120.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 280.00					\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 3,500.00	1		\$ 3,500.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 825.00	\$ 1,410.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 360.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 675.00	\$ 330.00					\$ 45.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 4,280.00	3		\$ 12,840.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 55.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00					\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 475.00	1		\$ 475.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 55.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00					\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 475.00	1		\$ 475.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 55.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00					\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 475.00	1		\$ 475.00	
			PART 7			\$ 35.00				\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00					\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 245.00	1		\$ 245.00	
PART 8													No Bid		\$ -	1		\$ -				
ALT #1	\$ 55.00														\$ 55.00	500	\$ 27,500.00	\$ 234,850.00				

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15

- Part 8 only applies to Location #13

SIGN BID	ADD	PARTS	LOC #1	LOC #2	LOC #3	LOC #4	LOC #5	LOC #6	LOC #7	LOC #8	LOC #9	LOC #10	LOC #11	LOC #12	LOC #13	LOC #14	LOC #15	Sub-Totals	Occurances	Alt. 1	Total	Totals	
			JJC	JC	SHERIFF & JAIL	DEPT OF TRANS	HLTH DEPT (AURORA)	CRT SRVCS (AURORA)	GOVT CENTER	ANIMAL CONTROL	BLDG MGMT SHER MAINT	SHERIFF & JAIL	HLTH DEPT (AURORA - VAC LOT)	JC (FESCUE AREA)	JC (POND AREA)	KBC	3RD ST CRTHOUSE						
CHRISTY WEBBER LANDSCAPES 2900West Ferdinand St Chicago, IL 60612 773.533.0477	X	1	PART 1	\$ 600.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 155.00	\$ 218.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 435.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,000.00		\$ 90.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 6,193.00	32		\$ 198,176.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 20.00							\$ 35.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 455.00	6		\$ 2,730.00
			PART 2B	\$ 50.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 20.00							\$ 35.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 405.00	6		\$ 2,430.00
			PART 2C	\$ 140.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 25.00							\$ 100.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 712.00	4		\$ 2,848.00
			PART 2D	\$ 140.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 25.00							\$ 75.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 687.00	4		\$ 2,748.00
			PART 2E	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 25.00							\$ 100.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 672.00	4		\$ 2,688.00
			PART 3	\$ 125.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00							\$ 200.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 807.00	4		\$ 3,228.00
			PART 4	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 35.00							\$ 100.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 1,175.00	2		\$ 2,350.00
			PART 5	\$ 1,820.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 230.00							\$ 250.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 6,290.00	1		\$ 6,290.00
			PART 6B	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 400.00							\$ 400.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 7,580.00	3		\$ 22,740.00
			PART 6C	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 50.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 9,880.00	1		\$ 9,880.00
			PART 6D	\$ 475.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 70.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 2,035.00	1		\$ 2,035.00
			PART 6E	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 50.00							\$ 50.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,965.00	1		\$ 1,965.00
			PART 7			\$ 1,150.00				\$ 150.00	\$ 950.00							\$ 800.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,550.00	1		\$ 4,550.00
PART 8														\$ 1,500.00			\$ 1,500.00	1		\$ 1,500.00			
ALT #1	\$ 60.00																\$ 60.00	500	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 266,158.00			
SEBERT LANDSCAPE 30W741 Butterfiled Rd Naperville, IL 630.236.9350	X	1	PART 1	\$ 190.00	\$ 490.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 1,400.00		\$ 75.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 4,380.00	32		\$ 140,160.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	6		\$ 600.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	6		\$ 600.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00						\$ 30.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 350.00	4		\$ 1,400.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 40.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 40.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 445.00	4		\$ 1,780.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 15.00						\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 265.00	4		\$ 1,060.00	
			PART 3	\$ 100.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 30.00						\$ 50.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,795.00	4		\$ 7,180.00	
			PART 4	\$ 150.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 45.00						\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 1,805.00	2		\$ 3,610.00	
			PART 5	\$ 200.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 175.00						\$ 150.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 3,405.00	1		\$ 3,405.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 500.00						\$ 100.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 3,880.00	3		\$ 11,640.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 350.00						\$ 80.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 3,800.00	1		\$ 3,800.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 100.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 40.00						\$ 60.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,240.00	1		\$ 1,240.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 50.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 30.00						\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 765.00	1		\$ 765.00	
			PART 7			\$ 400.00				\$ 65.00	\$ 300.00						\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 965.00	1		\$ 965.00	
PART 8													\$ 3,500.00			\$ 3,500.00	1		\$ 3,500.00				
ALT #1	\$ 55.00															\$ 55.00	500	\$ 27,500.00	\$ 181,705.00				
LOCAL LAWN CARE & LANDSCAPING 10 s 112 Schoger Dr Naperville, IL 60564 630.338.5793	X	1	PART 1	\$ 128.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 400.00		\$ 70.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 2,493.00	32		\$ 79,776.00	
			PART 2A	\$ 10.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 5.00						\$ 5.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 260.00	6		\$ 1,560.00	
			PART 2B	\$ 10.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 5.00						\$ 5.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 370.00	6		\$ 2,220.00	
			PART 2C	\$ 150.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 25.00						No Bid	\$ 310.00	\$ 1,575.00	4		\$ 6,300.00	
			PART 2D	\$ 150.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 25.00						No Bid	\$ 180.00	\$ 1,065.00	4		\$ 4,260.00	
			PART 2E	\$ 150.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 25.00						No Bid	\$ 180.00	\$ 1,465.00	4		\$ 5,860.00	
			PART 3	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 475.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 40.00						\$ 290.00	\$ 149.00	\$ 2,379.00	4		\$ 9,516.00	
			PART 4	\$ 370.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 855.00	\$ 60.00						\$ 385.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 4,105.00	2		\$ 8,210.00	
			PART 5	\$ 320.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 690.00	\$ 75.00						\$ 195.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 2,510.00	1		\$ 2,510.00	
			PART 6B	\$ 575.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 410.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 880.00	\$ 185.00						\$ 60.00	\$ 265.00	\$ 4,005.00	3		\$ 12,015.00	
			PART 6C	\$ 600.00	\$ 975.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 1,110.00	\$ 195.00						\$ 85.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 4,610.00	1		\$ 4,610.00	
			PART 6D	\$ 75.00	\$ 710.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 145.00						\$ 110.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 2,090.00	1		\$ 2,090.00	
			PART 6E	\$ 145.00	\$ 620.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 110.00						\$ 45.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 2,420.00	1		\$ 2,420.00	
			PART 7			\$ 1,850.00				\$ 590.00	\$ 2,368.00						\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,980.00	\$ 7,913.00	1		\$ 7,913.00	
PART 8													\$ 1,095.00			\$ 1,095.00	1		\$ 1,095.00				
ALT #1	\$ 75.00															\$ 75.00	500	\$ 37,500.00	\$ 150,355.00				

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15

- Part 8 only applies to Location #13